CITY OF MT. PLEASANT
2008 SPRING TREE BID-- SPECIES TABULATION

SCHAEFFER'S .
SPECIES ACORN FARMS BAY LANDSCAPING, INC. KAN Kggﬁigﬁcsm Y| cHrisTmAS TREE FARM | SCHICH TE,ng NURSERY
& NURSERY )
PRUNUS SERRULATA $28.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID $55.00
(KWANZAN FLOWERING CHERRY) (Prunus subhirtella **1-3/8" (Prunus subhirtella
Acceptable Substitute: Autumn 'Autumnalis’) 'Autumnalis’)
Blooming Cherry (Prunus subhirtella
'Autumnalis’)
MALUS PRAIRIFIRE $36.00 $58.00/$53.00 $56.00 NO BID $40.00
(RED FLOWERING CRABAPPLE) |** Purple Prince Crabapple|] ** Robinson Crabapple
1-1/2" 1-3/4";
Royalty Crabapple 1-3/4"
MALUS BRANDYWINE $27.00 $58.00 $56.00 NO BID $40.00
(DEEP PINK/RED FLOWERING **1.25" (Substitute: Centurion
CRABAPPLE) Crabapple)
Acceptable Substitute: Centurion
Crabapple (Malus centurion)
QUERCUS RUBRA $58.00 $67.00 NO BID NO BID $64.00
(RED OAK) (Pin Oak) ** English Oak 1-3/4"
Acceptable Substitute: Pin Oak
(Quercus palustris)
SYRINGA RETICULATA NO BID $81.75 NO BID NO BID $64.00
(JAPANESE TREE LILAC) **1-3/4"

** TREES DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS -- UNACCEPTABLE SUBSTITUTES, TREE SIZE, ETC.




